
SLT-MOBITEL Introduces a Range
of  Ultimate  All-in-One  Postpaid
Packages

SLT-MOBITEL Mobile has introduced the revolutionary M+ Postpaid Individual
packages, which are flexible and feature-rich and cater to customers’ evolving
needs. 

The packages are designed to deliver unparalleled connectivity, convenience, and
value, redefining the Postpaid mobile experience for individuals. SLT-MOBITEL’s
postpaid  packages  are  backed  by  the  country’s  fastest  mobile  network  and
guarantee seamless connectivity across Sri Lanka. 

The new M+ Individual Postpaid portfolio offers plans crafted to suit diverse user
requirements, presenting four tiers of connectivity and benefits. Each package
offers an Anytime Any App DATA Bundle (HD quality, without daily limits) with
DATA rollover, UNLIMITED Calls to Any Network, 200 SMS to Any Network, an
Extra 5GB for Facebook, WhatsApp, and YouTube, and competitive excess data
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usage rates of just 10 cents per MB. 

The All-in-One packages provide the above features in addition to the Medium
Plan, which offers 5GB for Anytime Any App DATA at just 700 rupees + tax. The
Large Plan delivers 10GB for Anytime Any App DATA at 1,000 rupees + tax. The
Xtra Large Plan enables Anytime Any App DATA 20GB, priced at 1,400 rupees +
tax, and the ultimate XXL Plan presents Anytime Any App DATA 40GB for 2,200
rupees + taxes. 

The  M+  Individual  Postpaid  Plans  provide  unparalleled  flexibility  with
customizable add-on features. Customers can tailor their experience by selecting
data  add-ons  to  best  suit  their  needs,  whether  it’s  Social  Media  packs  like
Facebook, WhatsApp, YouTube, Entertainment packs like Netflix, Prime Video,
Productivity apps like Zoom, Teams, Office 365, Google Meet, or Social media
apps like TikTok and Instagram available on demand. 

The M+ Postpaid plans highlight SLT-MOBITEL’s commitment to empowering Sri
Lankans with innovative and customer-centric solutions, ensuring everyone enjoys
a hassle-free, feature-packed connectivity experience through its award-winning
network.  The Mobile  network has been recognized as  the fastest  4G Mobile
network by Ookla,  the global  leader in  fixed broadband and mobile  network
testing applications, data, and analysis. 


